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September 9, 2024 
 
FROM: Dr John WorldPeace JD 
DrJohnWorldPeaceJD@gmail.com 
 
Re: My experience at UNM in attempting to talk about establishing a Teach Peace/ 
Peace Studies curriculum leading to a BA, MA, PhD. There are no such curriculums in 
any university in the world human society. This is a true enigma considering the global 
predatory society we all live in. 
 
 
GENERALLY THIS EMAIL TO: All personnel in all universities and colleges in the 
United States and the world. This particular email is addressed to the personnel of the 
University of New Mexico. 
 
The General Statement of Purpose of this email: There is no university in the world 
human society that offers a curriculum that leads to a BA, MA, PhD in “Peace Studies” 
therefore I am trying to create one. I have no competition in this effort. I have no peers 
in this effort. 
 
The Specific Statement of Purpose of this email: I, Dr John WorldPeace JD, have 
accumulated the material and significant personal experiences, research, 
documentation and articles and commentary related to a Teach Peace curriculum. 
40,000 pages on JohnWorldPeace.com. I am now trying to find a university interested in 
becoming the hub of this project: the hub to which all the universities in the world will 
connect.  
 
As I work through contacting every university in the USA and then the world, I am going 
to keep a record of the response I get from every university. The effort to create a 
Teach Peace curriculum is a Teach Peace subject in and of itself. This record will 
definitively relate the obstacles to Teach Peace in universities. This is a secular 
endeavor but it definitely has a significant religious/spiritual aspect. 
 
Note: As a career salesman for my personal businesses, my experience was that every 
potential customer contact resulted in information to refine my approach. As I gather 
unique information, university to university, I will adjust my “sale pitch” accordingly to be 
more clear and effective..  
 
The foundational issues of Peace are on my website: JohnWorldPeace.com ; which 
contains 42,000 pages. The entire site is related to increasing the peace in the world 
human society, locally and globally, which is referenced in other pdf documents 
attached to this website. 
 
Specific Objective of This Document: To relate my personal experience in approaching 
the University of New Mexico in Albuquerque, for the purpose of setting up a Teach 
Peace curriculum. My experience with UNM is what I am expecting to potentially be 
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both the same and unique with other universities. By emailing all the universities in the 
world, starting with the United States, starting with the University of New Mexico, I want 
to identify the firewalls that I am going to encounter in finding a home for my Teach 
Peace curriculum. My process of trying to find a home for my Teach Peace curriculum 
will be an ongoing commentary of why there is no Teach Peace curriculum in any 
university in the world human society. 
 
In future emails, I will add a laundry list of objections to setting up the first Teach Peace 
curriculum and relate why universities are resistant to setting up a Teach Peace 
curriculum. 
 
I encourage everyone who has an opinion regarding this project to communicate their 
opinion to me by email. DrJohnWorldPeaceJD@gmail.com 
 
REPEAT: There is no Teach Peace curriculum in the world human society and that is a 
major reason why the world human society exists within so much chaos. The core 
question is: How can we increase the level of peace in the world human society if we do 
not Teach Peace? We can’t. 
 
DR JOHN WORLDPEACE JD: I am one man with on message: WorldPeace. My 
objective is to increase the level of peace in the world human society. I have no peers. I 
have no competition. I am going to attempt to change the world through increasing the 
peace within the world human society. I live a minimalist life. Ownership of assets 
requires time to maintain those assets. I have no desire to maintain or to pay someone 
to maintain ego centric possessions. Virtually every dollar that comes into this project 
will be spent to propagate and expand this project. In time all my art and all my books 
will be owned by this project. Virtually every object I possess is an object with no 
intrinsic value that had/has some spiritual inspiration for me. The only thing one takes 
out of one’s life back into the infinite immortal spiritual dreamscape is one’s 
experiences. All the rest is really just an illusion/delusion within the finite mortal earth 
dreamscape 
 
Now this communication is accompanied by the following relevant on point documents 
related to my Teach Peace objective. 
 
The nuts and bolts of content and marketing efforts of this project. My career has been 
one of self-employment providing insurance, accounting, tax, legal and web design 
services to small business owners. But first comes selling the potential client of their 
needs for the services I am offering. This WorldPeace Project is going to be the 
toughest of sales. 
 
Curriculum: My flagship website JohnWorldPeace.com and all my social media posting. 
This website has 42,000 and growing daily. 
 
My Resume is on this website. 
 



3 
 

DR JOHN WORLDPEACE’ PERSONAL EXPERIENCE IN SPEAKING WITH THE 
UNIVERSITY OF NEW MEXICO ABOUT SETTING UP A TEACH PEACE 
CURRICULUM. 
 
First, in April 1988, after my first divorce and three weeks before I was going to turn 40, 
I legally, changed my name to John WorldPeace. Almost immediately within a week I 
began to write a book on peace titled The Common Denominators of Peace and 
Peaceful Coexistence. In 1993, I sent a query to Harper San Francisco about publishing 
my book. The CEO was interested but after several months of communication, the CEO 
said one of his VPs killed the project by saying “That books on Peace do not sell.” With 
some books and ideas you have to create the market. 
 
I had changed the book title to “The Book of Peace” at the CEO’s suggestion. I made 
two other significant marketing attempts after having 165 books printed. However, I was 
simply too busy with my businesses to pursue any marketing and the price charged by 
those who did publish and market books was too much in my opinion. I had started 
insurance, accounting, tax and law businesses and in 2003 began a web design 
business. All successful. But these businesses, plus a family, and then a divorce in 
1987 left no time for marketing my “Book of Peace”. 
 
Second, in 2017 I made my first effort to set up a Teach Peace curriculum. 
https://worldpeaceteachingpeace.com/DrJohnWorldPeaceJdTeachPeaceCurriculum.as
p. This is the snail-mail inquiry I made directly to about 250 Presidents/Chancellors of 
various universities in the USA regarding setting up a Teach Peace curriculum. No 
response 
 
Third, after an extensive expansion of my Teach Peace curriculum, I realized I needed 
to go to UNM (University of New Mexico) in person and see what it was going to take to 
accomplish my marketing goala. Correspondence was not going to work. Like in my 
other businesses, I initially needed face to face input and that would not come from 
correspondence. 
 
Having moved from Texas to Albuquerque, New Mexico in 2011, it made sense to me 
that this is where I needed to begin to find a university to Teach Peace. 
 
On August 14, this year, I went to UNM to find out who I needed to talk to about 
initiating a Teach Peace curriculum. I went to the main employment office at University 
and Lomas. I was buzzed in and talked to a woman who asked me what I was trying to 
accomplish She told me that I needed to go to Shoales Hall to see the woman who 
handled new courses. I went to the second floor Shoales Hall and talked to 3 women 
who asked me more details and said that I needed to see Ms? Cheek but that she was 
not there and would not be back until Friday the 16th because she was on vacation. I 
was also told that school started the next Monday the 19th. I told them I would not come 
back until the week after school started to avoid the confusion of the first week of 
school.  
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This woman also said that I should go over to the political science department where 
the Ist Court of Appeals and the Law School were located. I went over there and there 
were three women just finishing lunch and we talked about 20 minutes. Very cordial. 
One gave me a map of the campus and showed me where things were. I said it was too 
hot to walk around campus and I would have to come back. 
 
I went back on the 28th and went again to Shoales Hall. The secretary got up from her 
desk and took me down the end of the hall and told about 8 women standing there I was 
looking for Ms? Cheek. They all pointed to his woman about 65. She indicated I follower 
her and on the way to an office she said she only had 3 minutes that she had 
an appointment. This was not her office. Her office was down the hall where I had been 
on the 14th. We sat down at a small table. She told me twice again she only had three 
minutes.  
 
I took out a 21 page document I had typed up regarding setting up a Teach Peace 
curriculum and a copy of a letter I had sent to Presidents of universities back in 2017. 
(Se above link). I put them on the table and pushed them to the center. She did not 
make any effort to touch them. I told her I wanted to discuss a Teach Peace curriculum. 
I told her I was told she was the one I was told was in charge of being the first to review 
new classes. She said she was. I have no experience with universities except ten years 
as a student.I never has any issues that required me to see anyone in administration. 
 
She said they already had a couple of classes on peace. I said I was talking about a 
curriculum for a BA, MA, PhD.  She interrupted me and said they had tried to set up a 
Teach Peace studies that did not work. I said I would expect that. There are no experts 
in that field. She said some other similar things and each time I said, “Been there done 
that”. I then said I had a Peace website with 42,000 pages on it. She looked a bit 
shocked. But said nothing. 
 
Then she said in a very short statement that a course like that would by state law have 
to be headed up by a PhD on staff. She was rushing so I did not ask her how they 
would find such a person since there was no such PhD curriculum at any university in 
the world. 
 
Then she got up and said she had an appointment. Then she said I could look into 
some peace clubs on campus. I said again “Been there done that.” I was not given time 
to say it was all in the documents I gave her. 
 
She was right in my face and I said you don’t have a Peace Studies that leads to a BA, 
MA, PhD do you and she again looked shocked (that I was still challenging her) and 
paused and said no. 
.  
She had not looked or even touched what I had given her. So in 3 minutes and without 
looking at what I gave her and without asking me any questions about my experience 
and qualifications she had made a decision that I was wasting her time.  
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As far as she was concerned the time I had was up and there was no point in me 
returning. No statement that she intended to look at what I gave her. 
 
~~~ 
 
When I walked out into the large hallway there were about 8 campus cops there. I 
thought something was going on. A cop got in my way without saying anything. I asked 
if he wanted to talk to me. 
 
He asked me what I was doing there and I said I was told to come and talk to this 
Cheek woman about starting a teach peach curriculum.  
 
I asked what this was about. And he said someone said I had a gun. I said I didn’t. And I 
took off my pack which had 12 of my 150 books in it and put it on the floor and he 
examined it. Then without being asked, I raised my hands and told him to search me    if 
he wanted. He got behind me and patted me down and indicated to the other cops I had 
no gun. 
 
Then he asked if the “Dr John WorldPeace JD” embroidered on my shirt pocket was my 
name and I said yes. It did not make sense to him so he asked for my drivers license 
and I gave it to him. He glanced at it and gave it to a cop who seemed to be the 
supervisor who took it and ran it and a few minutes later gave it back to the cop in front 
of me and said I was clear. Then he asked me if I was a vet because I had on one of vet 
caps. I said yes, Army Sgt 70-72.. 
 
Then he said I could not carry a gun on campus. And I said I have no gun. He said it 
was against the law to bring a gun on campus. And I repeated that I had no gun but 
New Mexico had an open carry law and I did take my derringer 95% of where I went 
because I was 76 and looked like a target and that Albuquerque was a dangerous place 
and I had been confronted about 3 times. That is also a reason I wore my Vet cap.  
 
I also told him that there were signs on the door to the bank and the VA that said guns 
were prohibited. And I told him that I saw no signs anywhere on campus, at the 
entrances or on the buildings or elsewhere that guns were prohibited. He made no 
comment. Nor did he comment when I brought it up two or three more times. 
 
I practiced law in Texas for 20 years and I knew generally you need to give people 
notice on issues regarding guns. But I did not say that. 
 
Then he told me that I could not come into that building without an appointment since I 
was not a student or employee of the University. I again said I had seen no signs on the 
building or anywhere else that entrance to Shoales Hall was restricted. Again he did not 
respond. 
 
I also said that I was not told any of this by any of the three places I had been 14 days 
prior. Again no comment. 
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Then after about 20 minutes of conversation, he said he would have to escort me off 
campus. I did not bother to ask him why. He did say several times thanks for my 
cooperation. 
 
So he says where is your car. I said I am on a motorcycle and I was turned around and 
did not know where it was. So we walked around the building and I could still not get 
oriented. It was only my second time on campus. After 13 years in Albuquerque, I had 
only been on campus maybe twice just riding around and that was 5-7 years prior and 
only for 10 minutes. 
 
We walked around the building and I saw the church where I had parked and I started 
moving in that direction. We got about 100 yards away and he stopped me and another 
cop drove up. This cop got out of his car with some papers and told me that I could 
never come back on campus. I said “Never?” and he said 72 hours that he needed time 
to figure out what was going on. 
 
I said nothing was going on except I was trying to see the Cheek woman. He gave me a 
document that I had to sign.There is a copy at the bottom of the Teach Peace page. It is 
yellow. 
 
Then I went to my motorcycle and got ready to leave. They had a cop in a car to make 
sure I drove off campus which was about 100 yards to the main street. 
 
I decided not to ask any questions but that I would write this letter and send it to every 
email address I could find on the UNM campus which was about 550. I have had a 
computer since 1980 and a web design business so I knew how to harvest emails on 
any business.  
 
I decided that being confronted over 38 years since I changed my name, that it would 
do no good to challenge anyone with negative attitudes about peace.  
 
I wanted to write this document because I wanted to make a point of a real time 
situation with people reacting to someone named WorldPeace. And in particular the 
reaction in a university environment with a lot of authority figures. So this will be a cover 
letter to all the universities I contact in pursuit of my Teach Peace objectives. I fully 
understand the resistance people have to Peace and WorldPeace. So, UNM has 
become an example of that negative attitude toward peace. 
 
The fact is that people talk about wanting peace but they instinctively hate peace. The 
reason is very simple. People hate change more than they hate peace. And increasing 
the peace means change and the knee-jerk attitude is “not interested”.  
 
And Christians tell me no peace until Jesus comes. I ask them if they object if I try to 
increase the peace while we wait for Jesus. The truth is that for Jesus to create a 
perfect peace he will have to turn everyone to stone.  
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